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Prompt 1
Welcome to Creative Property Management – South Florida’s trusted local
property management company. With over 25 years in the business, we
pride ourselves on delivering world-class service tailored to your
property management needs. Please stay on the line, and a member of
our dedicated team will speak with you shortly.

Prompt 2
As a trusted A+ BBB rating, partnering with us isn’t just the smart choice,
but the best one. And while we’re specialists in managing rental
properties, we’re also equipped to support you as you buy your dream
home or sell your current one. Visit creativeproperty.com to see all we’re
capable of, log in to your personal portal, and check out our frequently
asked questions.

Prompt 3
Founded 25 years ago, we’ve constantly evolved by combining our
experience with the latest technology to ensure smooth rental processes
for our clients and tenants. Browse properties and services in full at
creativeproperty.com…someone will be with you shortly.

Prompt 4
Creative Property Management is the one-stop solution for your property
needs in South Florida. From tenant relations, accounting, timely
maintenance, 24-7 emergency services, to tenant screening and
cutting-edge property management technology, we’re here to serve you



with professionalism and dedication. Your call will be connected in just a
moment, please stay on the line.

Prompt 5
Facing a maintenance emergency? Our 24-7 hotline is always available
for your peace of mind and safety. Whether it’s a water leak or a
malfunctioning stove, we prioritize your wellbeing and comfort. Don’t
forget to ask about our emergency services when we connect your call.

Prompt 6
Ready to make your move? Simply apply online via our website at
creativeproperty.com, or pick up a paper application from our West Palm
Beach office. Browse through our available properties and ensure you
provide all necessary documents for a smooth application process. If in
doubt, reach out to us over email on contact info@creativeproperty.com
and we’ll be happy to help.


